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  8:45 Welcome – Brian Moore, DJO Global 
 
  9:00  Introduction – Scott Anderson ATC 
 
  9:10  “HIPAA” 
  Jill Raines 
 
  9:35 “FERPA” 
  Amanda Miller 
 
10:00 CDM Sport – Steve McGee 
 
10:10 Break and Checkout of Rooms 
  Courtesy of CDM Sport 
 
10:30 “What an Athletic Trainer Needs to Know: The Plaintiff’s Perspective” 
  Eugene Egdorf 
 
11:10 “What an Athletic Trainer Needs to Know: The Defendant’s Perspective” 
  Steven Pachman 
 
11:50 Questions / Discussion 
 
12:00 Lunch 



 

 

 
 
Jill Bush Raines has been an attorney for the University of Oklahoma for 18 years and has served as the University’s 
HIPAA Privacy Official since 2008.  She is responsible for HIPAA compliance on the University’s three campuses and for 
a variety of other legal issues, including human subjects research, student and employee grievances, and patient care 
matters. Jill graduated from the University of Oklahoma College of Law, Order of the Coif, and holds master’s degrees 
and an undergraduate degree from OU.  She has served as an adjunct professor in the College of Law and the Graduate 
College, an administrative law judge, and an editor for West Publications. Jill has held various positions with the National 
Association for College and University Attorneys for the past several years and is currently on the Publications Board for 
the Journal of College and University Law.  She is a member of the Oklahoma State Bar Association and is also admitted 
to practice in the United States Supreme Court. 
 
 
Amanda F. Miller graduated with Distinction from the University of Oklahoma College of Law and holds an undergraduate 
degree from OU.  She currently serves as Legal Counsel at the University of Oklahoma.  Prior to coming to OU, Amanda 
was Deputy General Counsel to then Oklahoma Governor Frank Keating, where her work concentrated on issues of 
Oklahoma law and legislation and, thereafter, worked for the Oklahoma City law firm of Foliart, Huff, Ottaway and Bottom 
as a litigation attorney, specializing in medical malpractice and products liability defense.  Amanda has worked for the 
University of Oklahoma for the past five years and was formerly the University's Open Records Officer.  She frequently 
advises clients regarding issues of federal and state law related to student matters, including student privacy and 
education records, and is one of the University attorneys responsible for handling FERPA issues for the University.  
Amanda’s current practice also focuses on the areas of employment law, administrative hearings/grievances and contract 
drafting/dispute.  Amanda is a member of the Oklahoma Bar Association, Oklahoma County Bar Association and National 
Association of College and University Attorneys.      
 
 
Eugene R. Egdorf attended the University of Texas at Austin, where he earned his undergraduate degree with honors in 
1988. He earned his law degree the University of Texas School Of Law, where he was a member of the Order of the Coif 
and graduated with honors in 1991. Mr. Egdorf was honored in the "Texas Rising Stars" list in Texas Monthly magazine in 
2005 and 2006. He served as an expert source for a major news network regarding the Bowl Championship Series and 
has served as a panelist at the Fordham Sports Law Symposium. Mr. Egdorf recently acted as lead counsel in a high-
profile case representing the family of Rice University student athlete Dale R. Lloyd II in a wrongful death lawsuit against 
the National Collegiate Athletic Association (NCAA). The settlement resulted in the NCAA recommending for the first time 
that all collegiate student athletes be tested for the sickle cell trait.  In 2004, Mr. Egdorf and Mr. Lanier obtained a 
multimillion-dollar settlement for syringe manufacturer Retractable Technologies in an antitrust case against Becton 
Dickinson & Company, the world's largest manufacturer of medical syringes and needles. The case was settled one week 
before trial was scheduled to begin. Mr. Egdorf and The Lanier Law Firm also represented medical device manufacturer 
Rochester Medical Corp. in its long-running antitrust litigation against a group of companies that allegedly created a 
monopoly in the catheter market. Rochester Medical filed suit against its rivals in March 2004, and since that time Mr. 
Egdorf has negotiated several multimillion-dollar settlements for his client.  Mr. Egdorf is licensed to practice in all Texas 
courts, as well as United States District Courts in the Southern, Eastern and Northern Districts of Texas. He is a member 
of the State Bar of Texas, Houston Young Lawyers Association, and Houston Bar Association. Mr. Egdorf also is admitted 
to the U.S Court of Appeals for the Fifth Circuit, U.S. Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit and Supreme Court of the 
United States. Mr. Egdorf is also a certified contract advisor with the NFL Players Association as well as for the Canadian 
Football League.  Mr. Egdorf resides in Houston with his wife Laura and son Matthew. He is an active volunteer for the 
Alliance for Lupus Research, and recently served as chairman of a major fundraising activity for the organization.  
 
 
Steve Pachman is a Partner in the Litigation Department of the Philadelphia, Pennsylvania-based law firm, Montgomery 
McCracken.  He represents a number of major corporations, including multi-national companies, in various matters, 
including complex commercial litigation, product liability actions, contract disputes, and personal injury defense.  As part of 
his personal injury defense practice, Steve advises school officials and attorneys, athletic trainers, team physicians, and 
risk managers on institutional liability issues related to sport-related concussions.  He has authored a number of articles 
on the topic of how athletic trainers and other can minimize their risk of legal liability for sport-related injuries, and his 
comments and opinions on related issues have been published by the Chronicle of Higher Education and other 
organizations.  Recently, Steve represented a Philadelphia-based university, an athletic trainer, and others in a high-
profile, nationally-publicized lawsuit involving a catastrophically-injured football player who allegedly sustained a 
concussion and Second Impact Syndrome.  Steve is a Phi Beta Kappa graduate of the University of Maryland, College 
Park, where he was a Dean’s Scholar and graduated summa cum laude.  He received his law degree from Temple 
University School of Law, where he graduated cum laude and was an editor on the Temple Law Review.  


